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Instructions for Candidates:

1. Attempt ANY FOUR Questions out of given SIX Questions.
2. Simple Calculators are allowed to be used.

3. Working Notes should form part of the answer.

4. Answers to theory questions should be brief and to the point.

1(a) Give any four differences between Cash basis and Accrual basis of acounting. [4 Marks]

(b) Give any four differences between Straight Line Method and Written Down Value Method. [4 Marks]

(c) Give any four differences between FIFO and LIFO. [4 Marks]

(d) Give any four differences between Periodic and Perpetual Method of Inventory Valuation. [4 Marks]

(e) Define Depletion and Amortisation. [2.75 Marks]

2. Journalise the following transactions in the Journal of PARMATMA:

Maximum Marks

01 Jan 2021 Started business with Cash " 4,00,000, Goods " 2,00,000, Furniture * 1,00,000.

01 Jan 2021 | Opened Current Account with * 2,00,000.

02 Jan 2021 | Placed an order with Ritik Roshan for the supply of goods of the list price of
*2,00,000. In this connection, we paid 9% of the list price as an advance by
cheque.

03 Jan 2021 Ritik Roshan supplied goods of the list price of *2,00,000 less 12% trade
discount. Packing and Delivery charges * 2,000.

04 Jan 2021 Purchased goods from Murli of the list price of *2,00,000 less 12% trade
discount and paid him by cheque under a cash discount of 5%.

05 Jan 2021 Received an order from Shyam for supply of goods of the list price of * 2,00,000
with an advance of 10% of list price.

06 Jan 2021 Supplied the above goods at 10% trade discount. Packing and delivery charges
* 2,000.

07 Jan 2021 | Goods costing * 1,60,000 sold to Mr X at a profit of 20% on sales less 10% trade
discount and received a cheque under 2% Cash discount.

08 Jan 2021 | Goods (Cost " 6,000, Sale Price * 8,000) taken away by the proprietor for his
personal use.

09 Jan 2021 | Shyam became insolvent and paid 80 paise in a rupee in full & final settlement.

10 Jan 2021 Paid Ritik 80% on account.

11 Jan 2021 | Goods (Cost * 6,000, Sale Price * 8,000) stolen.

12 Jan 2021 Paid Life Insurance Premium * 2,000.

13 Jan 2021 | Cash embezzled by an employee * 2,000.

[18.75 Marks]

175



3. From the following particulars, prepare Bank Reconciliation Statement of PRITHVI as at 31st March 2021

1. Balance as per Cash Book 800
2. Cheques received and recorded in Bank Column but not

yet sent to Bank for collection 2,000
3. Cheques deposited into the bank but not recorded in the Cash Book 4,000
4. Cheques deposited but not yet collected by the Bank 3,000
5. Cheques issued but not yet presented for payment 5,000
6. Bank Charges debited in Pass Book only 400
7. Interest allowed in Pass Book only 200
8. Insurance Premium paid directly by Bank under standing advice 1,000
9. Bills receivables directly collected by the Bank 4,000

10. Cheques deposited for collection, returned dishonoured and

recorded in Pass Book only 2,000

11. ‘Cheques Issued’ returned on technical grounds 600

12. A wrong debit given by bank in pass book 1,600

13. A wrong credit given by bank in pass book 800

14. Bills discounted dishonoured but not recorded in Cash Book 8,000

15. Direct payment by a customer into the bank but not recorded in Cash Book 1,400

16. A Cash receipt recorded in Bank Column 2,000

17. A Cash payment recorded in Bank Column 1,200

4. JAL & AGNI Ltd provides you the following information:

Date Particulars

01.04.2018 | Purchased 10 second hand Machines for * 18,00,000. incurred * 1,40,000 towards
freight & insurance, * 40,000 towards carriage inward, Residual Value * 8,19,200,
Useful life 4 years.

01.01.2019 | Incurred * 14,000 towards Repairs and * 6,000 on installation of machines and *
24,000 towards Annual Insurance Premium and commenced the commercial
production.

01.10.2019 | Sold one machine at a profit of 10%

01.01.2021 | Incurred * 20,000 on repairs of Machines

01.01.2021 | Sold one machine at a loss of 10% and purchased a new machine for * 1,80,000
and spent * 20,000 on its installation

Required: Prepare the Machinery Account for three financial years using WDV Method assuming the rate of Depreciation @20%.

[18.75 Marks]

5. From the following information, prepare Statement of Profit and Loss of VAYU for the year ended 31st March, 2021:

Particulars ( in lacs)
Revenue from Operations 5,210
Other Income 80
Cost of Materials consumed 2000
Changes in Inventories (550)

[18.75 Marks]



Employee Benefits Expense

1,700

Finance Costs 40
Depreciation and Amortization Expense 300
Other Expenses 200
Tax Rate @ 30%
[18.75 Marks]
6.Following in the Balance Sheet of AAKASH Ltd as at 31.3.2021:
Particulars
I.  EQUITY AND LIABILITIES
(1) Shareholders’ Funds
(a) Share Capital(including 18% Pref. Share Capital * 2,00,000) (* 10 each) 5,00,000
(b) Reserves and Surplus 3,00,000
(2) Non-Current Liabilities
Long-term Borrowings 16,00,000
(3) Current Liabilities
Short-term Borrowings 80,000
Trade Payables 2,00,000
Other Current Liabilities 2,80,000
Short-term Provisions 2,40,000
Total 32,00,000
IIl.  ASSETS
(1) Non-Current Assets
Fixed Assets Tangible
(i) Tangible Assets 18,00,000
(ii) Intangible Assets 3,00,000
Non-Current Investments 1,00,000
(2) Current Assets
Current Investments 40,000
Inventories 3,80,000
Trade Receivables 5,20,000




Cash & Cash Equivalents 20,000

Short-term Loans & Advances 20,000
Other Current Assets(Prepaid Expenses) 20,000
Total 32,00,000

Net Profit after Interest & Tax for the year 2020-2021 " 7,20,000, Tax Rate 30%, Profit distributed as Equity Dividend " 4,10,400,
Operating Expenses " 7,20,000, Market Price of an Equity Share * 456, Net Sales * 48,00,000.

Required: Calculate (a) Gross Profit Ratio, (b) Operating Ratio, (c) Net Profit Ratio, (d) Interest Coverage Ratio (e) Return on Total
Assets (f) Return on Investment, (g) Return on Shareholders’ Funds (h) Return on Equity Shareholders’ Funds.(i) Earning Per Share,
() Dividend per Share, (k) Dividend Payout Ratio, (I) Earning Yield, (m) Dividend Yield, (n) Price Earning Ratio
[18.75 Marks]
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3FAEaRt & faw A

1. foU 91T o e # & fhegl IR 9eEl & 3ca] AoV
2. TTYROT FFolel F 3TANT FA H AT ¢

3. gfcheT sllcd &l 3k T fgwar s anfgu]

4. Vgifds &l & 3ok dfared 3R T glet a1fgu|

g.1. (a) a@iea & S afgw (Cash basis) ik 3mp3rer sfdw (Accrual basis) & &=
HIg IR IR TS| (4 37F)

(b) ®e = #¥s (Straight Line Method) 3k Rea s@a g #us ( Written
Down Value Method) & s g I 3idT sas| (4 3i)

(c) o (Last In, First Out) 3k & (First In, First Out) & & #5 I”R 3R
qATSA| (4 37)
(d) = (3=dd)) Heishel T @S IR Had AT & fw HI$ TR IR IqSd|

(4 3)

(e) f:2wor (Depletion) 3tk aReesr (Amortisation) s aRenfya Hifsw|  (2.75 37)

¥.2. UACAT (PARMATMA) & Sioiel H fasafai@a deeaT fir seter ufafsear fifo:

01 STeTair | 4,00,000 TUA ke, 2,00,000 TUX &1 AT 3R 1,00,000 9
2021 F BT o GIY <TG IRA T

01 SfeTardl | 2,00,000 ¥4I Aehe, & Te], WIAT Elell|
2021

02 SToTadl | it AT & 2,00,000 TIF HeT & AT H AT & fow




2021 T G ATl 39 HOU A, gAS % @t HA F w9 A g
AT & 9% $TITaTT o |

03 AT | Ffdh AT o 12% IR FT & AT 2,00,000 T0F FoT &

2021 el 1 3Mqfct i1 dfher AR Behedr e 2,000 T9|

04 STl [ 12% AR < & A1 2,00,000 T9F & Hed HT ATl Tler

2021 3R 38 Ak @RI 5% HT oiehe, Fe & TBA 3T fohar|

05 SIeTelT [TH F 10% 3HfIF & |y 2,00,000 T9F Hed & AT @l

2021 3MYfct & e 3Mer gred R

06 AT | 3RIFd TEIT FT 10% SAMRE e W A H| dfFar 3R

2021 feeliady arsr 2,000 &9

07 SteTadl | A TeFE T TS 9T 20% F T & |1 1,60,000 Hed HT AT

2021 10% SUMUR Qe HH X 997 T AR 2% e B & g
Teh A 9o faha|

08 StetadY | ATfleh €@RT AT (AT 6,000 92, T fashr #eT 8,000

2021 FI) 39 fAS sEaATer & forw o Srar 7|

09 Stetady | QI fearferar gt arm 3R qot 3R 3ifas Aues & s aud &

2021 80 & T AT TR

10 STl | i T 80% 3YaTclleT fonar|

2021

11 STeTerT | (T 6,000 ¥ud, foreenr fasht #ea 8,000 &) & Aol TR

2021 gl |

12 STeTel | SiteeT stAT MfATH 2,000 F9L I 3T |

2021

13 ST | Tk FHHATRY GaRT 2,000 T e 1 AT |

2021

(18.75 3ia)



w.3. fetier 31 AT 2021 H G T eifaf@a faazon & gt &1 d6 FAe fGaor Gar
ENI DR

faor THA (T0)
1. U3 FET (FT TH) & IHTAR AT TR 800
2. 9% ured Y AR I A & gor A G vy
Afthet 318 Tk HaIg & AT dF H F7E A | 2,000
3. U % # SAT T 7T, oAfheT e g A gof 7€ fhw vl 4,000
4. Uk dh H AT fhU 1T, WAfehel e garT 3 ok agel gl fev Tl 3,000
5. 9 ST fohv a1 oifehed TaTl & foIw 318 g g =16t fhw arwl 5,000
6. % o hae IH g H sfee A =) 400
7. saTSl fACT hael 9rH o & gof faar I 200
8. TR FeATE & T deh @RI WY s1araT foham Iram <t NfATA| 1,000
9. d Z@RT W USRI R T g7 foeA | 4,000
10. afell A & AU 86 & A7 v 7T A, d6 G@RT IR dier U v 3R FHaer &
% A &1 ) 3| 2,000
11. S T 3T A& dF ganrT dwelidr IR W dler G | 600
12. 919 g% # d @RI aTord sfae g a3 1,600
13. d% @RI U g% H Ieid shise fear 800

14, 1T 91T fqeT HATGRT g1 T offehad her g & eof o161 fohw aw| 8,000
15. IMgh GaRT deh H WY T FY AT 1T AT Sher g & gof oAdT g3

1,400
16. S FIdd H o7 Tohe W | 2,000
17. S A H &l sehe ST | 1,200

faair | fdawor

01.04.2018 [18,00,000 ¥W& H 10 s g5 AMA WIET AT AT gors 3R T & fav
1,40,000 T9& @Y T, #AMAT T 3w gells & foIw 40,000 T9F @ o6,
a1 JafAse Hed 8,19,200 T0d g, AT &1 IuAN Shae 4 a¥ 7 gl

01.01.2019 |#MaT Fr AFAT & AT 14,000 T, ARG H TA9aT 9T 6,000 T9F 3R
ariSes AT NAIH & TT H 24,000 39F @I HT 3T gr aioifcdes Icaiged
xR




01.10.2019 |tua #AMT 10% oM o =i =Y &

01.01.2021 |#M=T Fir ATFAT W 20,000 9 @I fHU U §)

01.01.2021 |vs ®MT 10% & Fha W SN A A v 75 AMA 1,80,000 F0F #
T =AY § 3R sEHr TAUET 9T 20,000 TOF @I FU R

(18.75 3i=)

4. s R HPT fA0 I3ToF wHer FAefaf@a Iearl g ga FT

20% FeTETH HN &I AT Seegidl (Reol 13«7 deq) Tgfd F 39T F §U il ety ast
& forr #feTdr @rar IR fIS| (18.75 3h)

5. el Seerl & feafieh 31 &M, 2021 @ AT gl aldl a¥ & faw arg & amr 3R
glfel &1 fdaxor IR Hife:

faavor A (d1E)

IRaTereT & Ieed 5,210
AT A 80
gad hd I AT i A9 2000
AT g 7 aRadeT (550)
FHAART H TT 1,700
ICRGIEEGIEIG] 40
Aogrd AR aReeT gy 300
3T G 200
IR T @ 3%

(18.75 3i=)

9.6. f&sIreh 31.03.2021 & 3TAR 3ThTeT fafAes &1 SECACE] IGES IR



. gfeFadt 3R geraTiRar

(1) RRURH Fr A

(a) AR IS (18% FqIaT M™WR Yl 2,00,000 T4 &fga) 5,00,000
(10 T TcIh)

(b) Rerad 3R 3rfaey 3,00,000

(2) IR-adAA Tard

STl & 3YUR 16,00,000

(3) TdATT SIATY

3eT-Hlel FUR 80,000

SR Selarar 2,00,000

3= e SeTeriRal 2,80,000

eUehiforh JTaene 2,40,000

e 32,00,000

. |qfed

(1) IR-ada = Fafed

e "afed A

(i) A Fufea 18,00,000

(i) 3 |afed 3,00,000

IR-adATT g 1,00,000

(2) ad#TT gufcadn

adAe fAaer 40,000




HTCRET 3,80,000
SaTies gy 5,20,000
sThe, 3R e THDET 20,000
3eqahifeler ROT 3R 373 20,000
T IIAT Fufeadl (NUs <) 20,000

graT 32,00,000

a¥ 2020-2021 & AT sars 3R & & 1 g oM 7,20,000 T9F &0 &, T 1 & 30%, Saraer
e & ¥ A AARA AT 4,10,400 FUF H g, IR@Ie a4 7,20,000 TR F §, A WK
T STSTR Hed 456 T9F &, Y& fashr 48,00,000 T9F &7 &

IUTAT HITSA: (a) Fehel o1 37qUTd, (b) TRETCIT 3eIUTd, () Y& AT Hequrd, (d) AT ksl
3ATd () Pl Huled W Reat (f) A W Reel, (g) RURH & B8 W W Reel (h) giFad
YR & % W arqdT| (i) I A 3, (j) Tfd AT 1AL, (k) ST $ITcAT 3eqard, ()
3T T I, (M) ST 31, (n) Hed 3Holel 3edrd|

(18.75 3ih)




